
Since 2013,
Abhimanyu has been helping companies 
build path-breaking offerings and create 
a culture of innovation excellence.
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2019 -        

Abhimanyu Bhardwaj

Abhimanyu Bhardwaj is an innovator on 
a mission to improve the lives of people 
living in India. 

He truly believes that India has the 
potential to impact the world. 

Therefore he strives to inspire and 
mentors changemakers across the 
country and the world.

He is an entrepreneur with a 
background in innovation, marketing, 
product development and GTM. 

He has lived in two continents and 
co-founded two companies - 21ID, an 
innovation consulting firm for startups 
and corporations and Launchspace, an 
organization that future-proofs 
individuals and companies with 
Innovation.

Through Launchspace, Abhimanyu has 
created a large scale impact on 
entrepreneurship learning across 
institutions in the south of India, 

impacting over 2300 students and 100s 
of faculty members.

Abhimanyu is also a Mentor of Change 
at Niti Aayog’s Atal Innovation 
Mission, where he guides schools on 
including innovation in their curriculum.

He mentors early stage entrepreneurs 
on creating business plans and raising 
capital. 

He is a partner on the EU India 
Innocenter project, where he is helping 
European startups set up operations 
and scale in India.

In addition to that, Abhimanyu is a 
speaker in different events, a facilitator 
in Marketing, Branding and Innovation 
projects, and a mentor for accelerator 
programs.

He has facilitated over 150 hours of 
training and workshops on 
Entrepreneurship, Innovation and 
Design Thinking.
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